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INTRODUCTION
Purulent pericarditis is seen rarely nowadays due to the
development of effective antibiotic therapy. The most
common cause of mediastinitis is perforation of the
esophagus. Esophageal perforations result from foreign
bodies, iatrogenic, spontaneously or esophageal
tumors. Purulent pericarditis and mediastinitis due to
esophageal perforation are associated with high
morbidity and mortality since length of the hospital stay
is long and the treatment is difficult. The morbidity and
mortality in esophageal perforation is most often due to
leakage of gastric content and food into the media-
stinum. The therapeutic strategy may be conservative,
or invasive. Surgical intervention is needed in the
majority of incidents.1-3
We report a case of late-diagnosed esophageal rupture
with purulent pericarditis and mediastinitis, that was
successfully managed.

CASE REPORT
A 60-year-old previously healthy man felt as if food was
stuck in his chest when he had dinner, but the symptom
disappeared shortly thereafter. After a few days, the
patient was admitted to cardiology clinic with chest pain.
Transthoracic echocardiography of the patient revealed
1.7 cm localised pericardial effusion without cardiac
tamponade. After 3-day treatment, he was discharged
due to the recovery of chest pain and laboratory test
parameters. The patient was admitted to this emergency
department complaining of persistent fever, chest pain,

shortness of breath 5 days after discharge. His complete
blood count showed inflammatory findings: CRP, in
104.1 mg/dl and white blood cell count 22,190/mm3. His
chest computed tomography (CT) demonstrated an
increase in the size of the pericardial effusion, air in the
pericardial sac and mediastinum but no mass lesion in
esophagus (Figure 1). Under general anesthesia, fiber-
optic and rigid esophagoscopy were performed. The
esophageal perforation and purulent material coming
from the perforation were seen in posterior part of the
esophagus at 25th cm from the incisor teeth but no
foreign body or esophageal mass were seen. A right
thoracotomy was performed. Sero-purulent pleural
effusion was aspirated and sent for biochemical
analysis. Mediastinum and pericardium were very tense
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Figure 1: Thorax CT of patient.

Figure 2: (a) Drainage of purulent material with right thoracotomy in
pericardium intraoperatively.
(b) CT of patient with chest tubes and esophageal stent. (1 chest tube in right
hemithorax, 1 chest tube in pericardium, 1 chest tube in left hemithorax and
esophageal stent in esophagus).
(c) Control chest radiography of patient after 3 months.
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and hard. Mediastinum and pericardium were incised,
and purulent material and air were drained (Figure 2a).
Pericardial dense fibrotic tissue was debrided. Pericardial
window was opened. Two chest tubes were inserted in
the thorax. A left anterior thoracotomy was performed in
fifth midclavicular area to examine the left thoracic cavity
and pericardium. Serous-purulent pleural fluid was
drained. Pericardium was opened, and dense fibrotic
tissue was debrided in the pericardium. A chest tube was
inserted. An esophageal stent (ES) was placed for
esophageal perforation (Figure 2b). The patient was
referred to intensive care unit. Oral intake was stopped,
parenteral nutrition was continued. ES migration was
seen on postoperative day 22 and replaced. The patient
was allowed to drink sips of water at 28 days
postoperatively. On postoperative day 30, he began a
normal diet. He was discharged without complication on
postoperative day 35. The ES was removed successfully
on postoperative day 71. The control porter-anterior (PA)
chest X-ray was good and the patient had no complaint
(Figure 2c).

DISCUSSION
Various etiologies, such as foreign bodies, tumors,
iatrogenic or spontaneous tears can cause intrathoracic
esophageal perforation. Intrathoracic esophagus and
pericardium are located in the posterior and middle
mediastinum, respectively, and the esophagus is attached
to the parietal pericardium.4 If the esophageal content
contaminates the mediastinum due to esophageal tear,
it causes inflammatory reaction and infection in the
mediastinum and pericardium. Mediastinal infection and
abscess can lead to serious clinical conditions such as
sepsis and multiorgan failure which can cause death, if
not treated immediately.3 In this case, we thought that
rupture was caused by stuck food in the esophasus. The
patient had not previously mentioned the history of food
impaction until he was asked. Detailed history taking,
and CT findings had alerted to think of esophageal tear
and so esophagoscopy was performed. Detailed history
taking is important in any case, especially in an older
patient.5
Esophageal perforation with mediastinitis is a life-
threatening disease. A delay in diagnosis may result in
poor prognosis or mortality. Surgical or nonsurgical
treatment option has been offered but there is no
standard treatment procedure. Treatment is planned
according to the elapsed time between perforation and
diagnosis, size and location of the perforation, and the
patient's health condition. Murakawa et al. suggested
that the gold standard therapy is thoracotomy, laparo-
tomy or both. They also suggested primary closure and
esophagectomy according to the occurrence of sepsis.6
Although, these surgeries are also done with thoraco-
scopic and laparoscopic techniques nowadays, these
techniques are performed for vitally stable patients

and indications are limited.6 Some authors suggest
conservative treatment for esophageal perforation such
as treatment with antibiotics, nilorally and ES.7 Late-
diagnosed esophageal fistula cannot be treated by
primary suturing due to contaminated tissues.8 In this
case, the perforation was treated conservatively by
using self-expandable covered ES, antibiotics and nil
orally, since it was a delayed diagnosed case so the
option of repairing the tear with sutures due to necrosis,
inflammation and contaminated environment was not
considered.
Mediastinitis must be treated in esophageal perforation.
Draining the purulent material in mediastinum is the
main goal in the treatment of mediastinitis. The appro-
priate drainage is performed by surgical intervention.2
Surgical intervention can be done with thoracoscopic or
open surgery. In this patient, it was tried to perform
thoracoscopic surgery but after noting the mediastinum
and pericardium to be very thuk and regid, it was
decided to perform open surgery. It was a wise decision
that the open surgery was performed since there were
fibrotic tissues in the pericardium and it could not be
debrided by thoracoscopic technique.
In conclusion, detailed history taking is important in older
patients, especially who have chest pain. Draining
purulent material and debridement of necrotic and
fibrotic tissues in mediastinal space and pericardium are
important and should be the main goal of the treatment
of esophageal perforation; and ES can be used to
control the contamination.
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